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WITHDRAWAL

CONSEQUENCES OF CANCELLATION

You can revoke your contractual declaration within 14 days wi-
thout giving a reason by a clear declaration. The period begins 
after receipt of this instruction on a permanent data medium, 
however not before the contract is concluded and also not 
before our fulfillment of our information obligations in accor-
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In case of an effective cancellation, the services received on 
both sides must be returned. You are only obliged to pay com-
pensation for the service provided until the revocation if you 
were advised of this legal consequence before submitting your 
contractual declaration and have expressly agreed that we will 
start to perform the consideration before the end of the revoca-
tion period. If there is an obligation to pay compensation, this 
may mean that you still have to meet the contractual payment 

obligations for the period up to the revocation. Your right of 
withdrawal expires prematurely if, at your express request, 
the contract is fulfilled in full by both parties before you have 
exercised your right of cancellation. Obligations to reimburse 
payments must be fulfilled within 30 days. The period begins 
for you with the submission of your cancellation, for us with its 
receipt. 

dance with Article 246b § 2 paragraph 1 in conjunction with 
Article 246b § 1 paragraph 1 EGBGB. To meet the cancellation 
deadline, it is sufficient to send the cancellation in good time 
if the declaration is made on a durable medium (e.g. letter, fax, 
email). The revocation must be sent to:

I / We have taken note of the cancellation policy and consequences of the cancellation and request that a deposit be opened 
immediately. 

I / We expressly agree that the execution of the consideration will begin before the end of the cancellation period.

End of revocation


